NOTICE OF INTENDED AWARD

FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR VEHICLES

NAME OF BID: Pavement Markings for Driving Schools 1) ATE OF POSTING NOTICE 05/01/2007

BID OR RFP # ITB 023-07 (Mid Florida Tech) TIME 4:30PM EST

Advertising was published in: web site at: http://www.myflorida.com

OPENING OF BIDS OR PROPOSALS

Neil Kirkman Building
Location: Tallahassee, Florida Date: 04/30/2007 Time: 02:30 p.m.
Opened by: Bruce Lynn Tabulated by: _Wanda Sanders

WITNESSED BY and REPRESENTING

INTENDED AWARD
Vendor: Asphal Tech Price: $650.00

Terms:

Lowest Bidder: Yes X No

If no, Justification: Lowest Responsive Bidder, Negotiated a $100.00 Discount

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall
constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes. Any notice of protest or
protest to this solicitation which was filed prior to this posting is null and void. To be effective
any notice of protest or protest must be filed within limits set forth in this posting. In accordance
with section 120.573m FS, notice is hereby provided that mediation of the administrative dispute
for the type of agency action announced is not available.

CERTIFICATION

I certify that the above statements are correct. I further certify that the award of this bid is made
ce with section 287, Part I, Florida Statutes and Chapter 60A-1, Florida

jtrative Code.
ooy il sh/oT

<7 35 Ehief (Date)
Bureau of Purchasing and Contracts

(Title)
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NOTICE OF INTENDED AWARD
FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR VEHICLES

NAME OF BID; Pavement Markings for Driving Schools ) ATE OF POSTING NOTICE 05/01/2007

BID OR RFP # ITB 023-07 (Central Florida) TIME 4:30PM EST

Advertising was published in: web site at: http:/www.myflorida.com

OPENING OF BIDS OR PROPOSALS

Neil Kirkman Building
Location: Tallahassee, Florida Date: 04/30/2007 Time: 02:30 p.m.
Opened by: Bruce Lynn Tabulated by:  Wanda Sanders

WITNESSED BY and REPRESENTING

INTENDED AWARD
Vendor: Asphal Tech Price: $1,200.00

Terms:

Lowest Bidder: Yes X No

If no, Justification: Lowest Responsive Bidder, Negotiated a $150.00 Discount

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall
constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes. Any notice of protest or
protest to this solicitation which was filed prior to this posting is null and void. To be effective
any notice of protest or protest must be filed within limits set forth in this posting. In accordance
with section 120.573m FS, notice is hereby provided that mediation of the administrative dispute
for the type of agency action announced is not available.

CERTIFICATION

I certify that the above statements are correct. I further certify that the award of this bid is made
in accordance with section 287, Part I, Florida Statutes and Chapter 60A-1, Florida

Admiyistrative Code.
;ﬁﬁm{ (Niap sh o
Aﬁagtureé' (Date)

Bureau of Purchasing and Contracts
(Title)
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NOTICE OF INTENDED AWARD
FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR VEHICLES

NAME OF BID: Pavement Markings for Driving Schools ) ATE OF POSTING NOTICE 05/01/2007

BID OR RFP # ITB 023-07 (Pinellas) TIME 4:30PM EST

Advertising was published in: web site at: http://www.myflorida.com

OPENING OF BIDS OR PROPOSALS

Neil Kirkman Building
Location: Tallahassee, Florida Date: 04/30/2007 Time: 02:30 p.m.
Opened by: _Bruce Lynn Tabulated by: _Wanda Sanders

WITNESSED BY and REPRESENTING

INTENDED AWARD
' ‘Vendor: Asphal Tech Price: $1,300.00

Terms:

Lowest Bidder: Yes X No

If no, Justification; Lowest Responsive Bidder, Negotiated a $100.00 Discount

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall
constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes. Any notice of protest or
protest to this solicitation which was filed prior to this posting is null and void. To be effective
any notice of protest or protest must be filed within limits set forth in this posting. In accordance
with section 120.573m FS, notice is hereby provided that mediation of the administrative dispute
for the type of agency action announced is not available.

CERTIFICATION

I certify that the above statements are correct. I further certify that thé award of this bid is made
in accordance with section 287, Part I, Florida Statutes and Chapter 60A-1, Florida

Adminis tve Code.
Alaag. slilv
Stacy A YR, (Date)

Bureau of Purchasing and Contracls
(Title)
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NOTICE OF INTENDED AWARD
FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR VEHICLES

NAME OF BID: Pavement Markings for Driving Schools ) A TE OF POSTING NOTICE 05/01/2007

BID OR RFP # ITB 023-07 (South Florida) TIME 4:30PM EST

Advertising was published in: web site at: http://www.myflorida.com

OPENING OF BIDS OR PROPOSALS

Neil Kirkman Building
Location: Tallahassee, Florida Date: 04/30/2007 Time: 02:30 p.m.
Opened by: Bruce Lynn Tabulated by: Wanda Sanders

WITNESSED BY and REPRESENTING

INTENDED AWARD
Vendor: Asphal Tech Price: $12,872.65

Terms:

Lowest Bidder: Yes X No

If no, Justification: Lowest Responsive Bidder, Negotiated a $577.35 Discount

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall
constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes. Any notice of protest or
protest to this solicitation which was filed prior to this posting is null and void. To be effective
any notice of protest or protest must be filed within limits set forth in this posting. In accordance
with section 120.573m FS, notice is hereby provided that mediation of the administrative dispute
for the type of agency action announced is not available.

CERTIFICATION

I certify that the above statements are correct. I further certify that the award of this bid is made
in accordance with section 287, Part I, Florida Statutes and Chapter 60A-1, Florida

Administiitive Code.
At Ohiko I

T (Sigture) (Date)
Stacy Aﬂg?cmef
Bureau of Purchasing and Contracts

(Title)

4 oF &



NOTICE OF INTENDED AWARD
FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR VEHICLES

NAME OF BID: Pavement Markings for Driving SchoolsT) A TE OF POSTING NOTICE 05/01/2007

BID OR RFP # ITB 023-07 (Flagler) TIME 4:30PM EST

Advertising was published in: web site at: http://www.myflorida.com

OPENING OF BIDS OR PROPOSALS

Neil Kirkman Building
Location: Tallahassee, Florida Date: 04/30/2007 Time: 02:30 p.m.
Opened by: Bruce Lynn Tabulated by: Wanda Sanders

WITNESSED BY and REPRESENTING

INTENDED AWARD
Vendor: NO AWARD - NO RESPONSIVE BIDDERS  pyice:

Terms:

Lowest Bidder: Yes X No

If no, Justification:

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall
constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes. Any notice of protest or
protest to this solicitation which was filed prior to this posting is null and void. To be effective
any notice of protest or protest must be filed within limits set forth in this posting. In accordance
with section 120.573m FS, notice is hereby provided that mediation of the administrative dispute
for the type of agency action announced is not available.

CERTIFICATION

I certify that the above statements are correct. I further certify that the award of this bid is made
in accordance with section 287, Part I, Florida Statutes and Chapter 60A-1, Florida

Administratiye Code.
(\A%?(L{/OMM ST

(Slgn (Date)
Bureau of Purchasing and Cconhacls
(Title)
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NOTICE OF INTENDED AWARD
FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR VEHICLES

NAME OF BID: Pavement Markings for Driving Schools DATE OF POSTING NOTICE 05/01 /2007

BID OR RFP # ITB 023-07 (McFatter) TIME 4:30PM EST

Advertising was published in: web site at: http://www.myflorida.com

OPENING OF BIDS OR PROPOSALS

Neil Kirkman Building
Location: Tallahassee, Florida Date: 04/30/2007  Time: 02:30 p.m.
Opened by: Bruce Lynn Tabulated by: Wanda Sanders

WITNESSED BY and REPRESENTING

INTENDED AWARD
Vendor: NO AWARD - NO RESPONSIVE BIDDERS  price:

Terms:

Lowest Bidder: Yes X No

If no, Justification:

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall
constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes. Any notice of protest or
protest to this solicitation which was filed prior to this posting is null and void. To be effective
any notice of protest or protest must be filed within limits set forth in this posting. In accordance
with section 120.573m FS, notice is hereby provided that mediation of the administrative dispute
for the type of agency action announced is not available.

CERTIFICATION

I certify that the above statements are correct. I further certify that the award of this bid is made
in accordance with section 287, Part I, Florida Statutes and Chapter 60A-1, Florida

Adminjjtrative Code.
ﬁ”ﬂ,/l M 511107

s Gt

Bureau of Purchasiné and Contracts

(Title)
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FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY
SAFETY & MOTOR VEHICLES

BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER:

ITB 023-07

BID TITLE: Pavement Markings for Driving Schools

OPENING DATE: 04/30/2007
TIME: 2:30p.m.
POSTING TIME / DATE

FROM: 05/01 / 2007
UNTIL: _ 05/04 / 2007

FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITH THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUES, SHALL
CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUES. ALL BIDS/PROPQSALS
ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE STATE'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY AND ALL
ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS ARE REJECTED AND SHALL
HAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT. OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED HEREIN ARE THE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED
TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND TIME. ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO THIS
SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE. NOTICE OF BID/PROPOSALS PROTEST BONDING
REQUIREMENT. ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN ACTION PROTESTING A DECISION OR INTENDED DECISION
PERTAINING TO CONTRACTS ADMINISTERED BY THE DIVISION OR A STATE AGENCY PURSUANT TO SECTION
120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL POST WITH THE DIVISION OR THE STATE AGENCY AT THE TIME OF FILING
THE FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST, A BOND PAYABLE TO THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL
TO 1 PERCENT OF THE DIVISION'S OR STATE AGENCY'S ESTIMATE OF THE TOTAL VOLUME OF THE CONTRACT
OR $5,000, WHICHEVER IS LESS, WHICH BOND SHALL BE CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS
WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST HIM IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING IN WHICH ACTION IS BROUGHT

AND IN ANY SUBSEQUENT APPELLATE COURT PROCEEDING. FOR PROTEST OF DECISIONS OR INTENDED
PAGE(S) DECISIONS OF THE DIVISION PERTAINING TO AGENCIES’ REQUEST FOR APPROVAL OF EXCEPTIONAL
PURCHASES, THE BOND SHALL BE IN THE AMOUNT EQUAL TO 1 PERCENT OF THE REQUESTING AGENCY'S
ESTIMATE OF THE CONTRACT AMOUNT FOR THE EXCEPTIONAL PURCHASE REQUESTED OR §5,000, WHICHEVER
IS LESS. INLIEU OF A BOND, THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY AMY, IN EITHER CASE, ACCEPT A CASHIER'S
CHECK OR MONEY ORDER IN THE AMOUNT OF THE BOND. FAILURE TO FiLE THE PROPER BOND AT THE TIME
OF FILING THE FORMAL PROTEST, WILL RESULT IN THE DENIAL OF THE PROTEST.

BIDDERS NAME SCHOOL NAME PRICE TOTAL PRICE |
A & M Striping, Inc. Mid Florida Tech NON-RESPONSIVE NO BID BOND N/A
A & M Striping, Inc. Central Florida NON-RESPONSIVE NO BiD BOND N/A
A & M Striping, Inc. Pinellas NON-RESPONSIVE NO BID BOND N/A
A & M Striping, Inc. South Florida NON-RESPONSIVE NO BID BOND N/A
A & M Striping, Inc. Flagler NON-RESPONSIVE NO BID BOND N/A
A & M Striping, Inc. McFatter NON-RESPONSIVE NG BID BOND N/A
Asphal Tech Mid Florida Tech $650.00 $650.00 *
Asphal Tech Central Florida $1,200.00 $1,200.00 *
Asphal Tech Pinellas $1,300.00 $1,300.00 *
Asphal Tech South Florida $12,872.65 $12,872.65 *

OPENED BY: ‘_1_57—-%0(5 Lo N

REMARKS: PRICE WITH STAR { ) INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD. NOT AS SPECIFIED CODE(S):

TABULATED BY: \AJAIDA ANDEEJVERIFIED BY: (CRE(~  PhcwFoRD
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FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY
SAFETY & MOTOR VEHICLES

BID TABULATION

ITB 023-07

BID NUMBER: .

BID TITLE: Pavement Markings for Driving Schools
OPENING DATE: 04/30/2007

TIME: 2:30p.m.

POSTING TIME / DATE

FROM: 05/01 / 2007

UNTIL: 05/04 + 2007

FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITH THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUES, SHALL
CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUES. ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS
ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE STATE'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY AND ALL
ADDITIGNAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS ARE REJECTED AND SHALL
HAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT. OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED HEREIN ARE THE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED
TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND TIME. ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO THIS
SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE. NOTICE OF BID/PROPOSALS PROTEST BONDING
REQUIREMENT. ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN ACTION PROTESTING A DECISION OR INTENDED DECISION
PERTAINING TO CONTRACTS ADMINISTERED BY THE DIVISION OR A STATE AGENCY PURSUANT TO SECTION
120.57(3}, FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL POST WITH THE DIVISION OR THE STATE AGENCY AT THE TIME OF FILING
THE FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST, A BOND PAYABLE TO THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL
TO 1 PERCENT OF THE DIVISION'S OR STATE AGENCY'S ESTIMATE OF THE TOTAL VOLUME OF THE CONTRACT
OR 35,000, WHICHEVER IS LESS, WHICH BOND SHALL BE CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS
WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST HIM IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING IN WHICH ACTION IS BROUGHT
AND IN ANY SUBSEQUENT APPELLATE COURT PROCEEDING. FOR PROTEST OF DECISIONS OR INTENDED
PAGE(S) DECISIONS OF THE DIVISION PERTAINING TO AGENCIES’ REQUEST FOR APPROVAL OF EXCEPTIONAL
PURCHASES, THE BOND SHALL BE IN THE AMOUNT EQUAL TO 1 PERCENT OF THE REQUESTING AGENCY'S
ESTIMATE OF THE CONTRACT AMOUNT FOR THE EXCEPTIONAL PURCHASE REQUESTED COR $5,000, WHICHEVER
IS LESS. IN LIEU OF A BOND, THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY AMY, IN EITHER CASE, ACCEPT A CASHIER'S
CHECK OR MONEY ORDER IN THE AMOUNT OF THE BOND. FAILURE TQ FILE THE PROPER BOND AT THE TIME
OF FILING THE FORMAL PROTEST, WiLi RESULT IN THE DENIAL OF THE PROTEST.

BIDDERS NAME SCHOOL NAME PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Asphal Tech Flagler NO BiD N/A
Asphal Tech McFatter NOC BID N/A

OPENED BY: ROz LYNA

[TABULATED BY: b/ DA —SANDELS JVERFIEDBY: GREE T KE ol

REMARKS: PRICE WITH STAR { & ) INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD. NOT AS SPECIFIED CODE(S):
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