NOTICE OF INTENDED AWARD
FLCORIDA DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR VEHICLES

RiderCoach Trainer for FRTP RiderCoach Preparation Courses

NAME OF BID:

BID OR RFP No. |57 011-10 NOTICE POST DATE: | 2/22/2008 mve: _3.0C o
Advertising was published in: http:/fwww.myflorida.com/

OPENING OF BIDS OR PROPOSALS

Location: B409 Date: 12/17/2009 Time: 2:30 pm
Opened by: Bruce Lynn Tabulated by: Wanda Sanders

WITNESSED BY and REPRESENTING
Jared Kennedy

INTENDED AWARD

Multiple Award {see attached sheet) Multiple Award (see attached sheet)

Vendor: Price: §

Lowest Bidder: >< Yes No

If no, Justification:

Terms:

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver
of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes. Any notice of protest or protest to this solicitation which
was filed within the time limits set forth in this posting. In accordance with section 120.57(3), F8, notice is hereby
provided that mediation of the administrative dispute for the type of agency action announced is not available.

CERTIFICATION

I certify that the above-statements are correct. | further certify that the award of this bid is made in accordance
with Section 287 %rida Statutes and Chapter 60A-1, Florida Administrative Code.
/

yd |2./22/09
(Signattwe} {27 ' {Date) 4 /

- Chief of Purchasing and Contracts
(Title)

HSMV 95106 {Revised 06/21/07)




FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY
SAFETY & MOTOR VEHICLES

BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: ITB# 011-10

81D TITLE : RCT for the FRTP Courses
OPENING DATE: 121712009

TIME: 2:30 pm
POSTING TIME / DATE

FROM: 3:00pm f 12/22/2009
UNTIL: 3:00pm  / 12/28/2009

FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITH THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUES, SHALL
CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUES. ALL BIDS/PROPQSALS
ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE STATE'S TERMS AND CONDITICGNS AND ANY AND ALL
ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS ARE REJECTED AND SHALL
HAVE NQ FORCE AND EFFECT. OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED HEREIN ARE THE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED
TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND TIME. ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TG THIS
SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE. NOTICE OF BID/FROPOSALS PROTEST BONDING
REQUIREMENT. ANY PERSON WHOQ FILES AN ACTION PROTESTING A DECISION OR INTENDED DECISION
PERTAINING TO CONTRACTS ADMINISTERED BY THE DIVISION OR A STATE AGENCY PURSUANT TO SECTION
120.57(3}, FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL POST WITH THE DIVISION OR THE STATE AGENCY AT THE TIME OF FILING
THE FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST, A BOND PAYABLE TO THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL
TO 1 PERCENT OF THE DIVISION'S OR STATE AGENCY'S £STIMATE OF THE TOTAL VOLUME OF THE CONTRACT
OR $5,000, WHICHEVER IS LESS, WHICH BOND SHALL BE CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS
WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST HIM IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING IN WHICH ACTION IS BROUGHT
AND IN ANY SUBSEQUENT APPELLATE COURT PROCEEDING. FOR PROTEST OF DECISIONS OR INTENDED
PAGE(S) DECISIONS OF THE DIVISION PERTAINING TO AGENCIES' REQUEST FOR APPROVAL OF EXCEPTIONAL
PURCHASES, THE BOND SHALL BE IN THE AMOUNT EQUAL TO 1 PERCENT OF THE REQUESTING AGENCY'S
ESTIMATE OF THE CONTRACT AMOUNT FOR THE EXCEFPTIONAL PURCHASE REQUESTED OR $5,000, WHICHEVER
IS LESS. IN LIEU OF A BOND, THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY AMY, IN EITHER CASE, ACCEPT A CASHIER'S
CHECK OR MONEY QRDER IN THE AMOUNT OF THE BOND. FAILURE TO FILE THE PROPER BOND AT THE TIME
OF FILING THE FORMAL PROTEST, WILL RESULT IN THE DEMIAL OF THE PROTEST.

BIDDERS NAME UNIT PRICE QUANTITY SUB-TOTAL TOTAL PRICE
Cost Per day Total (Costx 7)
January / Sarasota
Jay Harrison $425 $2,975
Tim Jeror No Bid
FPMT $100 $700

Glenn Picklesimer $400 $2,800

Burke Breneman $550 $3,850

Agnes Mical 3575 $4,025

OPENED BY: Bruce Lynn [FABULATED BY: Wanda Sanders ~J VERIFIED BY:

REMARKS: PRICE WITH STAR ( « ) INDICATES INTENT TC AWARD. NOT AS SPECIFIED CODE(S):

PAGE: 1 OF




FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY
SAFETY & MOTOR VEHICLES

BiD TABULATION

BiD NUMBER: TB# 011-10

8i0 TITLE - RCT for the FRTP Courses
OPENING DATE: 121712009

TIME: 2:30 pm

POSTING TIME / DATE

FROM: 3:00 pm

1 120222009

UNTIL: 3:00 pm

[ 12/28/2009

FAILURE TQ FILE A PROTEST WITH THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUES, SHALL
CONSTITUTE A WAIVER QF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUES. ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS
ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE STATE'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY AND ALL
ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS ARE REJECTED AND SHALL
HAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT. QFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED HEREIN ARE THE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED
TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND TIME. ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO THIS
SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE  NOTICE OF BID/PROPOSALS PROTEST BONDING
REQUIREMENT ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN ACTION PROTESTING A DECISION OR INTENDED DECISION
PERTAINING TO CONTRACTS ADMINISTERED BY THE DIVISION OR A STATE AGENCY PURSUANT TO SECTION
120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL POST WITH THE DIVISION OR THE STATE AGENCY AT THE TIME OF FILING
THE FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST, A BOND PAYABLE TO THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL
TO 1 PERCENT OF THE DIVISION'S OR STATE AGENCY'S ESTIMATE QOF THE TOTAL VOLUME OF THE CONTRACT
OR $5,000, WHICHEVER IS LESS, WHICH BOND SHALL BE CONDITIONED UPQON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS
WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST HIM IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING IN WHICH ACTION IS BROUGHT
AND IN ANY SUBSEQUENT APPELLATE COQURT PROCEEDING. FOR PROTEST OF DECISIONS OR INTENDED
PAGE(S) DECISIONS QF THE DIVISION PERTAINING TO AGENCIES' REQUEST FOR APPROVAL OF EXCEPTIONAL
PURCHASES, THE BOND SHALL BE IN THE AMOUNT EQUAL TO 1 PERCENT OF THE REQUESTING AGENCY'S
ESTIMATE OF THE CONTRACT AMOUNT FOR THE EXCEPTIONAL PURCHASE REQUESTED OR $5,000, WHICHEVER
IS LESS. IN LIEU OF A BOND, THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY AMY, IN EITHER CASE, ACCEPT A CASHIER'S
CHECK OR MONEY ORDER IN THE AMOUNT OF THE BOND. FAILURE TO FILE THE PROPER BOND AT THE TIME
OF FILING THE FORMAL PROTEST, Wit RESULT IN THE DENIAL OF THE PROTEST.

BIDDERS NAME UNIT PRICE QUANTITY SUB-TOTAL TOTAL PRICE
Cost Per day Total (Cost x 7)
February / Clearwater

Jay Harrison $425 $2,975

Tim Jeror No Bid

FPMT $250 $1750

Glenn Picklesimer $400 $2,800

Burke Breneman $550 $3,850

Agnes Mical $575 $4,025

OPENED BY: Bruce Lynn |TABULATED BY: Wanda Sanders | VERIFIED BY:

REMARKS: PRICE WITH STAR ( + ) INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD. NOT AS SPECIFIED CODE(S): PAGE: 2 OF




BID TABULATION

FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY
SAFETY & MOTOR VEHICLES

BID NUMBER: ITB# 011-10

BID TITLE - RCT for the FRTP Courses
OPENING DATE: 121712009

TIME: 2:30 pm

POSTING TIME / DATE

FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITH THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120 57(3), FLORIDA STATUES, SHALL
CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUES, ALL BIDS/PROPQSALS
ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE STATE'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY AND ALL
ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS ARE REJECTED AND SHALL
HAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT. OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED HEREIN ARE THE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED
TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND TIME. ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO THIS
SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE. NOTICE OF BID/PROPOSALS PROTEST BONDING
REQUIREMENT. ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN ACTION PROTESTING A DECISION OR INTENDED DECISION
PERTAINING TO CONTRACTS ADMINISTERED BY THE DIVISION OR A STATE AGENCY PURSUANT TO SECTION
120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL POST WITH THE DIVISION OR THE STATE AGENCY AT THE TIME OF FILING
THE FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST, A BOND PAYABLE TQ THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL
TO 1 PERCENT QF THE DIVISION'S OR STATE AGENCY'S ESTIMATE OF THE TOTAL VOLUME OF THE CONTRACT
OR $5.000, WHICHEVER IS LESS, WHICH BOND SHALL BE CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS
WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST HIM IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING IN WHICH ACTION 1S BROUGHT
AND IN ANY SUBSEQUENT APPELLATE COURT PROCEEDING. FOR PROTEST OF DECISIONS OR INTENDED
PAGE(S) DECISIONS OF THE DIVISION PERTAINING TO AGENCIES’ REQUEST FOR APPROVAL OF EXCEPTIONAL

FROM: 3:00 pm / 12/22/2009 PURCHASES, THE BOND SHALL BE IN THE AMOQUNT EQUAL TO 1 PERCENT OF THE REQUESTING AGENCY'S
ESTIMATE OF THE GONTRACT AMOUNT FOR THE EXCEPTIONAL PURCHASE REQUESTED OR §5,000, WHICHEVER
UNTIL: 3:00 pm 12/28/2009 IS LESS. IN LIEU OF A BOND, THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY AMY, IN EITHER CASE, ACCEPT A CASHIER'S
CHECK OR MONEY ORDER IN THE AMOUNT OF THE BOND. FAILURE TO FILE THE PROPER BOND AT THE TIME
OF FIt ING THE FORMAL PROTEST. WILL RESULT IN THE DENIAL OF THE PROTEST.
BIDDERS NAME UNIT PRICE QUANTITY SUB-TOTAL TOTAL PRICE
Cost Per day Total (Costx 7)
April /Green Cove Springs
Jay Harrison $425 $2,975
Tim Jeror $450 $3,150
FPMT $450 $3150
Glenn Picklesimer $300 $2,100
Burke Breneman $550 $3,850
Agnes Mical No Bid
OPENED BY:Bruce Lynn [TABULATED BY: Wanda Sanders | VERIFIED BY:

REMARKS: PRICE WITH STAR { & ) INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD. NOT AS SPECIFIED CODE(S): PAGE: 3 OF



FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITH THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUES, SHALL

SAFETY & MOTOR VEHICLES CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUES. ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS
ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE STATE'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY AND ALL
BID TABULATION ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS ARE REJECTED AND SHALL

HAVE NG FORCE AND EFFECT. OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED HEREIN ARE THE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED
TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND TIME. ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO THIS
BID NUMBER: - ITB# 011-10 SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE HERFBY REJECTED AS LATE. NOTICE OF BID/PROPOSALS PROTEST BONDING
REQUIREMENT. ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN ACTION PROTESTING A DECISION OR INTENDED DECISION

BID TITLE : RCT for the FRTP Courses PERTAINING TO CONTRACTS ADMINISTERED BY THE DIVISION OR A STATE AGENCY PURSUANT TO SECTION
_ 120,57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL POST WITH THE DIVISION OR THE STATE AGENCY AT THE TIME OF FILING
QOPENING DATE: 121712009 THE FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST, A BOND PAYABLE TO THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL
TO 1 PERCENT OF THE DIVISION'S OR STATE AGENCY'S ESTIMATE OF THE TOTAL VOLUME OF THE CONTRACT
TIME: 2:30 pm OR $5,000, WHICHEVER IS LESS, WHICH BOND SHALL BE CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS
WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST HIM IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING IN WHICH ACTION IS BROUGHT
POSTING TIME / DATE AND IN ANY SUBSEQUENT APPELLATE COURT PROCEEDING. FOR PROTEST OF DEGISIONS OR INTENDED
PAGE(S) DECISIONS OF THE DIVISION PERTAINING TO AGENCIES’ REQUEST FOR APPROVAL OF EXCEPTIONAL
FROM: 3:00 pm [ 1272212008 PURCHASES, THE BOND SHALL BE IN THE AMOUNT EQUAL TO 1 PERCENT OF THE REQUESTING AGENCY'S
ESTIMATE OF THE CONTRACT AMOUNT FOR THE EXCEPTIONAL PURCHASE REQUESTED OR $5.000, WHICHEVER
UNTIL: 3:00pm / 12/28/2009 IS LESS. INLIEU OF A BOND, THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY AMY, IN EITHER CASE, ACCEPT A CASHIER'S
CHECK OR MONEY ORDER IN THE AMOUNT OF THE BOND. FAILURE TO FILE THE PROPER BOND AT THE TIME
OF FILING THE FORMAL PROTEST, WILL RESULT iN THE DENIAL OF THE PROTEST,
BIDDERS NAME UNIT PRICE QUANTITY SUB-TOTAL TOTAL PRICE
Cost Per Day X7 Days ERC (1 day) Total
May/Tampa
Jay Harrison $425 $2,975 $425 $3400
Tim Jeror No Bid
FPMT $250 $1750 $200 $1950 *
Glenn Picklesimer $350 $2450 $350 $2,800
Burke Breneman $550 $3850 $550 $4,400
Agnes Mical No Bid
JOPENED BY:Bruce Lynn _._.>mc_..>._.m_u BY: Wanda Sanders _ VERIFIED BY:

REMARKS: PRICE WITH STAR ( % ) INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD. NOT AS SPECIFIED CODE(S): PAGE: 4 OF 6




FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITH THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUES, SHALL

SAFETY & MOTOR VEHICLES CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUES. ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS
ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE STATE'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY AND ALL
BID TABULATION ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROPQOSERS ARE REJECTED AND SHALL

HAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT. OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED HEREIN ARE THE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED
TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND TIME. ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO THIS
BID NUMBER: ITB# 011-10 SOLICITATION, iF ANY, ARE HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE. NOTICE OF BID/PROPOSALS PROTEST BONDING
REQUIREMENT. ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN ACTION PROTESTING A DECISION OR INTENDED DECISION

BID TITLE : RCT for the FRTP Courses PERTAINING TO CONTRACTS ADMINISTERED BY THE DIVISION OR A STATE AGENCY PURSUANT TO SECTION
120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL POST WITH THE DIVISION OR THE STATE AGENCY AT THE TIME OF FILING
OPENING DATE: 121712009 THE FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST, A BOND PAYABLE TQ THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL
TO 1 PERCENT QF THE DIVISION'S OR STATE AGENCY'S ESTIMATE OF THE TOTAL VOLUME OF THE CONTRACT
TIME: 2:30 pm OR $5,000, WHICHEVER IS LESS, WHICH BOND SHALL BE CONDITIONED UFPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS
WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST HIM IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING IN WHICH ACTION IS BROUGHT
POSTING TIME / DATE AND IN ANY SUBSEQUENT APPELLATE COURT PROCEEDING. FOR PROTEST OF DECISIONS OR INTENDED
PAGE(S) DECISIONS OF THE DIVISION PERTAINING TO AGENCIES' REQUEST FOR APPROVAL OF EXCEPTIONAL
FROM: 300pm s 12/22/2009 PURCHASES, THE BOND SHALL BE IN THE AMGUNT EQUAL TCO 1 PERCENT OF THE REQUESTING AGENCY'S
ESTIMATE OF THE CONTRACT AMOUNT FOR THE EXCEPTIONAL PURCHASE REQUESTED OR $5,000, WHICHEVER
UNTIL: 3:00 pm ! 12/28/2009 IS LESS. IN LIEU OF A BOND, THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY AMY, IN EITHER CASE, ACCEPT A CASHIER'S
CHECK OR MONEY GRDER IN THE AMOUNT QF THE BOND. FAILURE TO FILE THE PROPER BOND AT THE TIME
OF FILING THE FORMAL PROTEST WLl RESULT iN THE DENIAL OF THE PROTEST,
BIDDERS z>_<=|m UNIT PRICE QUANTITY SUB-TOTAL TOTAL PRICE
Cost Per day _ Total (Cost x 7)
June Monticello
Jay Harrison $425 $2,975
Tim Jeror $450 $3150
FPMT $450 $3150
Glenn Picklesimer $350 $2,450 *
Burke Breneman $550 $3,850
Agnes Mical No Bid
[OPENED BY:Bruce Lynn - [TABULATED BY: Wanda Sanders | VERIFIED BY;

REMARKS: PRICE WITH STAR ( » ) INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD. NOT AS SPECIFIED CODE(S): PAGE: 5 CF 6




FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITH THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUES, SHALL

SAFETY & MOTOR VEHICLES CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUES. ALL BIDS/PROFPOSALS
ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE STATE’S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY AND ALL
BID TABULATION ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS ARE REJECTED AND SHALL

HAVE NG FORCE AND EFFECT. OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED HEREIN ARE THE ONLY OFFERS RECFIVED
TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND TIME. ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPCONSE TO THIS
SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE. NOTICE OF BID/PROPOSALS PROTEST BONDING
REQUIREMENT. ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN ACTION PROTESTING A DECISION OR INTENDED DEGISION
PERTAINING TO CONTRACTS ADMINISTERED BY THE DIVISION OR A STATE AGENCY PURSUANT TO SECTION
120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL POST WITH THE DIVISION OR THE STATE AGENCY AT THE TIME OF FILING
OPENING DATE: 12M17/2G09 THE FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST, A BOND PAYABLE TO THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL
TO 1 PERCENT OF THE DIVISION'S OR STATE AGENCY'S ESTIMATE OF THE TOTAL VOLUME OF THE CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: ITB# 011-10

BID TITLE - RCT for the FRTP Courses

TIME: 2:30 pm OR 85,000, WHICHEVER IS LESS, WHICH BOND SHALL BE CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS
WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST HIM IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING IN WHICH ACTION 1S BROUGHT
POSTING TIME / DATE AND IN ANY SUBSEQUENT APPELLATE COURT PROCEEDING. FOR PROTEST OF DECISIONS OR INTENDED
PAGE(S) DECISIONS OF THE DIVISION PERTAINING TO AGENCIES’ REQUEST FOR APPROVAL OF EXCEPTIONAL
FROM: 3:00 pm I 12/22/2009 PURCHASES, THE BOND SHALL BE IN THE AMOUNT EQUAL TO 1 PERCENT OF THE REQUESTING AGENCY'S
ESTIMATE OF THE CONTRACT AMOUNT FOR THE EXCEPTIONAL PURCHASE REQUESTED OR £5.000, WHICHEVER
UNTIL: 3:00 pm I 12/28/2009 ISLESS. INLIEU OF A BOND, THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY AMY, IN EITHER CASE, ACCEPT A CASHIER'S
CHECK OR MONEY ORDER IN THE AMOUNT OF THE BOND. FAILURE TO FILE THE PROPER BOND AT THE TIME
OF FILING THE FORMAL PROTEST. WILL RESULT IN THE DENJAL OF THE PROTEST.
BIDDERS NAME cz_ﬂ PRICE QUANTITY mc_w-.qom>_. TOTAL PRICE
Cost Per Day X7 Days ERC (1 day) Total
September/Tampa
Jay Harrison $425 $2,975 $425 $3400
Tim Jeror No Bid
FPMT $250 $1750 $200 $1950 *
Glenn Picklesimer $350 $2450 $350 $2,800
Burke Breneman $550 : $3850 $550 $4,400
Agnes Mical No Bid
OPENED BY: Bruce Lynn [TABULATED BY: Wanda Sanders [ VERIFIED BY:

REMARKS: PRICE WITH STAR ( % ) INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD. NOT AS SPECIFIED CODE(S): PAGE: 6 OF 6




